
Mera Peak Climbing Itinerary

Day 1: Arrival in Kathmandu

Upon your arrival at Tribhuvan International Airport in Kathmandu, you will be greeted by our representative
who will transfer you to your hotel. After settling in, you can explore the vibrant city of Kathmandu and
immerse yourself in its rich cultural heritage. You can visit the famous Durbar Square, which is home to
several historic temples and palaces, or explore the bustling streets of Thamel, which offer a range of shops,
restaurants, and bars.

 

In the evening, you will have a pre-trek briefing with your climbing guide, who will provide you with a
detailed itinerary and answer any questions you may have about the expedition. Overnight stay in
Kathmandu.

Day 2: Kathmandu City Tour

After breakfast, we will start our Kathmandu city tour, which includes visits to some of the most famous
cultural and historical sites in the city.

 

Our first stop will be Swayambhunath Stupa, also known as the Monkey Temple, which is one of the most
sacred Buddhist sites in Nepal. Located on a hilltop, the stupa offers stunning views of the city and is home
to several shrines, statues, and prayer wheels.

 

Next, we will visit Patan Durbar Square, which is a UNESCO World Heritage Site and home to several
ancient temples, palaces, and courtyards. Patan Durbar Square is renowned for its Newari architecture and is
a testament to the rich cultural heritage of the Kathmandu Valley.

 

We will then proceed to Pashupatinath Temple, which is one of the most important Hindu temples in the
world and a UNESCO World Heritage Site. The temple is dedicated to Lord Shiva and attracts thousands of
pilgrims every year.

 

Our final stop will be Baudhanath Stupa, which is one of the largest stupas in the world and a UNESCO
World Heritage Site. The stupa is a sacred site for Buddhists and is surrounded by several monasteries and
shops selling Tibetan artifacts.

 



After the tour, we will return to our hotel in Kathmandu and prepare for the next day's journey to Lukla.
Overnight stay in Kathmandu.

Day 3: Fly to Lukla and Trek to Chutanga (3,100m/10,168ft) - 35 Minutes Flight and 4
to 5 Hours Trek

We will start the day early and head to the airport for our flight to Lukla, which is a small mountain town
located at an altitude of 2,860 meters. The flight takes about 35 minutes and offers stunning views of the
Himalayas.

 

Upon landing in Lukla, we will meet our trekking crew and begin our trek to Chutanga. The trail starts with a
descent towards the Dudh Koshi River and takes us through several small villages and farms.

 

We will then start ascending toward Chutanga, which is located at an altitude of 3,100 meters. The trek is
challenging and takes about 4 to 5 hours, but the stunning views of the Himalayan peaks make it worth the
effort. We will also pass through dense forests of rhododendron and oak trees, which are home to a variety of
wildlife.

 

Once we reach Chutanga, we will set up our campsite and rest for the night. Chutanga is a small village with
basic facilities, and we will have a chance to interact with the locals and learn about their way of life.
Overnight stay in Chutanga.

Day 4: Trek from Chutanga to Thuli Kharka (4,300m/14,104ft) via Zatrwa La
(4,600m/15,092ft) - 5 to 6 Hours Trek

We will wake up early and have breakfast before starting our trek towards Thuli Kharka via Zatrwa La. The
trail starts with a steep ascent towards Zatrwa La, which is located at an altitude of 4,600 meters. The climb
is challenging and requires a good level of fitness, but the views of the surrounding mountains make it worth
the effort. Once we reach the top of the pass, we will be rewarded with stunning panoramic views of the
Himalayas, including Everest, Lhotse, Nuptse, and Makalu.

 

We will then start descending towards Thuli Kharka, which is located at an altitude of 4,300 meters. The trail
takes us through beautiful alpine forests and pastures, and we will pass by several yak herders' huts and
grazing grounds. Once we reach Thuli Kharka, we will set up our campsite and rest for the night. Thuli
Kharka is a remote village with basic facilities, and we will have a chance to interact with the locals and learn
about their way of life. Overnight stay in Thuli Kharka.

Day 5: Trek from Thuli Kharka to Kothe (3,691m/12,107ft) - 6 to 7 Hours Trek

After breakfast, we will begin our trek toward Kothe, which is located at an altitude of 3,691 meters. The trail
takes us through beautiful forests of rhododendron and pine trees, and we will pass by several small streams
and waterfalls.

 



We will also have the opportunity to spot various species of birds and wildlife, including musk deer,
Himalayan thar, and wild boar. The trek is moderately challenging and takes about 6 to 7 hours to complete.

 

Once we reach Kothe, we will set up our campsite and rest for the night. Kothe is a small village with basic
facilities, and we will have a chance to interact with the locals and learn about their way of life. Overnight
stay in Kothe.

Day 6: Trek from Kothe to Thaknak (4,358m/14,295ft) - 3 to 4 Hours Trek

After breakfast, we will continue our trek towards Thaknak, which is located at an altitude of 4,358 meters.
The trail takes us through dense forests of rhododendron and juniper trees, and we will pass by several small
streams and waterfalls.

 

The trek is relatively short and takes about 3 to 4 hours to complete, but it is also challenging due to the high
altitude. As we gain altitude, we will notice a significant change in the landscape, with the forests giving way
to rocky terrain and snow-capped mountains.

 

Once we reach Thaknak, we will set up our campsite and rest for the night. Thaknak is a small village with
basic facilities, and we will have a chance to acclimatize to the high altitude and prepare for the next day's
trek. Overnight stay in Thaknak.

Day 7: Trek from Thaknak to Khare (5,045m/16,548ft) - 3 to 4 Hours Trek

After breakfast, we will continue our trek toward Khare, which is located at an altitude of 5,045 meters. The
trail takes us through rocky terrain, and we will pass by several glacial moraines and icy streams.

 

As we approach Khare, we will be greeted by stunning views of Mera Peak and the surrounding mountains.
The trek is relatively short and takes about 3 to 4 hours to complete, but it is also challenging due to the high
altitude.

 

Once we reach Khare, we will set up our campsite and rest for the night. Khare is the last settlement on the
trek, and we will have a chance to acclimatize to the high altitude and prepare for the next day's climb.
Overnight stay in Khare.

Day 8: At Khare – Acclimatization Day and Pre-Climb Training

Today is an acclimatization day in Khare, which is essential to prepare our bodies for the climb to Mera
Peak. We will spend the day resting and exploring the surrounding areas, taking short walks to higher
elevations to aid in acclimatization.

 

In the afternoon, our experienced climbing guides will provide us with pre-climb training, including the use
of climbing equipment such as ice axes, ropes, and crampons. They will also demonstrate techniques for



climbing on snow and ice and provide us with safety tips for the climb.

 

We will have plenty of time to ask questions and clarify any doubts we may have about the climb. This
training is crucial to ensure that we are well-prepared and confident for the climb ahead. Overnight stay in
Khare.

Day 9: Trek from Khare to Mera High Camp (5,780m/18,958ft) - 5 to 6 Hours Trek

After breakfast, we will continue our trek towards Mera High Camp, which is located at an altitude of 5,780
meters. The trail takes us through steep and challenging terrain, and we will pass by the Mera Glacier and the
Mera La pass.

 

As we climb higher, the air becomes thinner, and we will need to pace ourselves and take regular breaks to
acclimatize to the high altitude. The trek takes about 5 to 6 hours to complete, and we will be rewarded with
spectacular views of the Himalayan range.

 

Once we reach Mera High Camp, we will set up our campsite and rest for the night. This will be our base
camp for the climb to Mera Peak, and we will have a chance to rest and prepare for the climb. Overnight stay
in Mera High Camp.

Day 10: Summit Mera Peak (6,461m/21,193ft) and Trek to Khare (5,045m/16,548ft) - 11
to 12 Hours Trek/Climbing

Today is the most challenging and exciting day of the trek as we make our way to the summit of Mera Peak,
which stands at 6,461 meters. We will wake up early in the morning and have a quick breakfast before
starting the climb.

 

Our experienced climbing guides will lead us through the steep and challenging terrain, using their expertise
to ensure that we are safe and comfortable throughout the climb. As we ascend higher, the air becomes
thinner, and we will need to pace ourselves and take regular breaks to acclimatize to the high altitude.

 

We will climb over a glacier and cross a crevasse to reach the summit ridge, which is a narrow and exposed
ridge that leads to the peak. The views from the summit are breathtaking, and we will have a panoramic view
of the Himalayan range.

 

After spending some time on the summit, we will start our descent to Khare, which will take about 7 to 8
hours. We will retrace our steps through the steep and challenging terrain, taking care to descend safely.
Once we reach Khare, we will celebrate our achievements and rest for the night. Overnight stay in Khare.

Day 11: Contingency Day for Mera Peak Summit



This day is set aside as a contingency day for the Mera Peak summit. In case we are unable to summit the
peak due to bad weather or any other unforeseen circumstances, we will use this day to make another
attempt.

 

Alternatively, if we have already summited the peak on the previous day, we can use this day to rest and
recover, or we can use it to explore the beautiful surroundings of Khare.

 

We will have the option to hike to nearby viewpoints, visit the local monasteries and learn about the local
culture, or simply relax and enjoy the stunning mountain views. Overnight stay in Khare.

Day 12: Trek from Khare to Kothe to Thuli Kharka (4,300m/14,104ft) - 8 to 9 Hours
Trek

Today, we will start our descent back to Thuli Kharka. We will follow the same trail that we took on our way
up, passing through Kothe and enjoying the beautiful scenery along the way.

 

The trek from Khare to Kothe will take around 4 to 5 hours, and we will stop for lunch in Kothe. After lunch,
we will continue our descent to Thuli Kharka, which will take another 3 to 4 hours.

 

We will spend the night in Thuli Kharka, enjoying the fresh mountain air and stunning views of the
surrounding peaks. Overnight stay in Thuli Kharka.

Day 13: Trek to Lukla (2,840m/9,316ft) via Zatrwa La Pass (4,600m/15,088ft) - 5 to 6
Hours Trek

Today, we will continue our descent and make our way toward Lukla. We will trek through the Zatrwa La
Pass, which is located at an altitude of 4,600m/15,088ft, and offers breathtaking views of the surrounding
peaks.

 

The trek from Thuli Kharka to Zatrwa La Pass will take around 3 to 4 hours, and we will stop for lunch at the
pass. After lunch, we will begin our descent toward Lukla, which will take another 2 to 3 hours.

 

We will reach Lukla by late afternoon, and this will be our last night on the trek. We will have a farewell
dinner with our trekking team and celebrate the successful completion of our adventure. Overnight stay in
Lukla.

Day 14: Fly from Lukla to Kathmandu(1,400m/4,593ft) - 35 Minutes Flight

Today, we will take an early morning flight from Lukla back to Kathmandu. The flight will take around 35
minutes, and we will get stunning views of the Himalayas one last time as we fly back to the capital city.



 

Once we arrive in Kathmandu, we will transfer to our hotel and have some free time to rest or explore the
city on our own. In the evening, we will have a farewell dinner with our trekking team and share our
experiences from the trip.

 

Overnight stay in Kathmandu.

Day 15: Depart Kathmandu

Today is the last day of our Mera Peak climbing adventure, Depending on your flight schedule, you may
have some free time in the morning to explore the city or do some last-minute souvenir shopping.

 

Our representative will transfer you to the airport in time for your flight back home. We hope you had an
amazing experience climbing Mera Peak and exploring the beautiful landscapes of Nepal. Safe travels!
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